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1.0 Meeting called to order at 10:30 on Monday AM2
1.1 Proposed agenda:

1.2 Reviewed Patent Policy

1.2.1 No new Patents identified.

1.3 Set Agenda – see  525r4
1.4 Approval of Minutes from March 2009 – 11-09-0325r0

1.4.1 Approved by unanimous consent

1.5 Approval of Minutes from Telcon Minutes of March/April/May in 11-09-428r4
1.5.1 Approved by unanimous consent

1.6 Review 09-0525r3 Slide 14 Plan of record review

1.7 Review 09-0525r3 Slide 15 – Amendment ordering

1.8 Enforcement and communications of TGmb recommendations

1.8.1 With the clean-up of the revision draft, there are some clarifications that are needed in the amendments to not undo the TGmb clean-u
1.8.2 A Wednesday Plenary session tutorial could help all the Task Groups understand the guidelines and recommendations

1.8.3 Discussion on what the guidelines should be for language in the standard
1.8.4 Where are the recommendations recorded?
1.8.5 Consistency is a major issue that should be commented on.
1.8.6 Drafts of the standard and the interims are available for review

1.8.7 It is incumbent on all members of the WG to identify issues and comment on them when appropriate.

1.8.8 Current Amendments will need to apply the recommendations.  Change in the draft will occur for 3 reasons.  1. Comments being processed; 2.  Identified issues of Style; 3.  Amendments that are being rolled in. 

1.8.8.1 The Amendments will be professionally reviewed, and the quality of the amendments would most likely be a higher quality and have a higher level of review.

1.8.8.2 Changing of shall and is in Clause 7, is a rather editorial adjustment, but can be done as the amendments are rolled in if they have missed one or two.

1.8.9 When 11u or 11v are balloted, comments on the style are valid, but the TG will determine if they will do the work in the TG or in TGmb depending on when the comments are acted on.
1.8.10 How will the recommendations be communicated to the WG?

1.8.10.1 Action Item Matthew Gast – Present the recommendation to the WG.

1.8.11 Remember that quality of the document is the goal of most people.  Following poor examples are not a good excuse to perpetuate the eronious method.  Having a recommendation and a set of guidelines to help the new text match the guidelines in an effort to make the end document better.

1.9 Editorial update: 11-09/444r0

1.9.1 Review the process in how the drafts were created.
1.9.1.1 D0.01 technically equivalent to 802.11-2007

1.9.1.2 D0.02 includes 11k

1.9.1.3 D0.03 includes 11r

1.9.1.4 D0.04 includes 11y

1.9.1.5 D0.05 includes 11-08/1127r17

1.9.2 Motion to adopt D0.06 as the base draft later when all the comment resolutions are approved.

1.9.3 Review what the Editor sees in creating a draft

1.9.4 Review some of the changes between D05 and D06
1.9.4.1 A change to the agenda was requested to discuss the changes in D0.06 on Tuesday’s session.
1.9.4.1.1 No objection to the agenda change (see 0525r4)

1.10 Comment update
1.10.1 Call for comments closed with 104 comments last Nov

1.10.2 CID 61 & 62 are Power saving, and are included in 11-09/0003.  The specific revision will be determined as we resolve these comments.

1.10.3 A motion for comment group 10, 11 and 12 will need formal approval this week.

1.11 Doc 08-1127r19 was reviewed.

1.11.1 Changes to r19 are today’s issue.  We will review all the comments and include any changes the group feels is required
1.11.2 Group 10 – CID 58 – 

1.11.2.1 Motion: Approve comment resolutions in comment group 10 in Document 11-08/1127r18. 

1.11.2.1.1 Moved: Jon Rosdahl 2nd Mike Montemurro

1.11.2.1.2 Discussion:  Is the resolution being made to avoid work?  No, the commenter may bring some proposal at a later time and have issues in the draft commented on in the process of the LB process. 

1.11.2.2 Voting: 8-0-1 motion passes.

1.11.3 Group 11 – CID 16, 29, 53, 103

1.11.3.1 Review the resolutions for Group 11

1.11.3.2 Motion: Approve comment resolutions in comment group 10 in Document 11-08/1127r18. 

1.11.3.2.1 Moved: Mike Montemurro  2nd : Jon Rosdahl

1.11.3.3 Discussion: none

1.11.3.4 Voting: 7-0-3 motion passes

1.11.4 Group 12 – CID 5, 11, 12, 14, 18, 19, 20, 22, 26, 27, 28, 32, 37, 43, 54, 56,63, 68,  71, 77, 78, 81, 92.
1.11.4.1 Move CID 61, 62 and 101  to Group 13
1.11.4.2 CID 71 the resolution needs to be change to Accept in Principle from Accept.  A change was made, but not precisely as requested by the commenter.

1.11.4.2.1 Proposed Resolution: Accept in Principle.  Editor directed to solve issues to match style guide.

1.11.4.2.2 Question on how much detail needs to be in the comment changes.  Having the proposed change or at least the resolution include the exact changes that are required to resolve the comment.

1.11.4.2.3 Consensus on the new resolution for CID 71

1.11.4.3 Review list of Group 13 list.

1.11.4.4 Motion: Approve comment resolutions in comment group 12 in Document 11-08/1127r19. 

1.11.4.4.1 Moved: Mike Montemurro  2nd : Jon Rosdahl

1.11.4.4.2 Discussion – none

1.11.4.4.3 Voting 6-0-3 motion passes.

1.11.5 Review editorial notes in comment resolutions 
1.11.5.1 Review of annotated 08/1127r17

1.11.5.2 CID 7 proposes to change the resolution to accept the edit notes as part of the comment resolution.

1.11.5.2.1 The change proposed here is only partial.  Worse it relies on “receiving” as indicating STA role.  The BlockAck defines originator and recipient as terms that wholly determine role, and these should be used here instead.  Proposed change reword the last sentences of the first para of 9.10.2 as follows: “The recipient(#7) STA(#6) has the option of accepting or rejecting the request.  When the recipient(#7) STA accepts, then a Block Ack agreement exists between the originator and recipient.  When the recipient (#7)….need to add from file
1.11.5.2.2 Set to Group 14

1.11.5.3 CID 31
1.11.5.3.1  If it is worth doing here, it’s worth doing globally.  I globally replaced “IE” with information element or deleted it (where defining it as an abbreviation).  

1.11.5.3.2 The number of places that IE is used in the baseline was a small number of times.  And sometimes it was used as an abreviation, and sometimes spelled out. 

1.11.5.3.3 The TGma group did this before, and so there were some that may have been missed, or were introduced by subsequent Amendments (KRY)

1.11.5.3.4 Proposed to change the proposed resolution to be Accept in Principle – Make a global change of “IE” with “information element”, deleting the use of “IE” where it is being defined as an abbreviation.
1.11.5.3.5 Set to Group 14

1.11.5.4 CID 46

1.11.5.4.1 Consistency of the use of “Through” vs. “to”

1.11.5.4.2 So a global replace of “Through” vs. “to” with the exception of Annex C – which is a disaster and not able to edit some parts.

1.11.5.4.3 Proposed Resolution: Accept in Principle: Globally replace any use of “through” to “to” where it expresses a range.  Do not make any changes in Annex C.

1.11.5.4.4 Set CID 46  to group 14

1.11.5.5  CID 52

1.11.5.5.1 Note, the change is not to replace the entire cited text, but only the second sentence of the first para of 7.3.2.25.3 Please review that this is the correct interpretation.
1.11.5.5.2 Change the resolution to be: Counter.  Change the second sentence of the cited text to the following: “If the RSN Capabilities field is not present, the default value of 0 is used for all its subfields.”

1.11.5.5.3 Discussion on the sentence.

1.11.5.5.4 Consensus on the proposed resolution
1.11.5.5.5 Move to Group 14

1.11.5.6 CID 57

1.11.5.6.1 The proposed resolution included some information from TGv, so this is not possible at this time
1.11.5.6.2 Reviewing doc 08/1340r0 shows that one paragraph change needs to be removed until TGv is accepted.

1.11.5.6.3 Change the proposed resolution to exclude the paragraph.
1.11.5.6.4 Consensus on the proposed change.

1.11.5.6.5 Move to Group 14

1.12 Recessed 12:30

2.0 Monday PM1 – 

2.1 Called to order at 1:38pm

2.2 Change to agenda to continue with the editor notes review adding to Group 14 for later motion. 

2.3 CID 76
2.3.1 The resolution says Accept, but the cited text rejected the comment.  The submission rejects the comment.

2.3.2 Change the resolution to Reject.  See submission in 11-09/0051r1.

2.3.3 Suggest that we don’t point to submission if possible.  cut and paste if possible when small changes.
2.4 CID 90

2.4.1 Resolution says “Counter. Accept. “ change to Counter. Change all occurrences of “RC4” to “ARC4”, excluding in the PICs and Annex C..

2.4.2 The only RC4 in the PICs is something different.

2.4.3 Consensus to make the change

2.4.4 Move to Comment Group 14.

2.5 CID 94

2.5.1 Discussion on what the description should be.  If this was a description, then it would be better to place this in clause 11.  So a cross reference in clause 7 would be good.
2.5.2 New Proposed Resolution: Counter: Add the following text in 11.4.2 “The value of the Minimum PHY Rate in a TSPEC shall satisfy the following constraints:  The Minimum PHY Rate is in the AP’s operational rate set, for an uplink TS.  The Minimum PHY Rate is in the non-AP STA’s operational rate set, for a downlink TS.  The minimum PHY Rate is in the APs operation rate set and non-AP STA’s operation rate set, for a bidirectional TS.”  The editor is directed to re-word the text as necessary.  Add a reference to clause 11.4.2 at the cited location.

2.5.3 See 11-08/1127r20 for specifics.

2.5.4 Consensus on the proposed resolution

2.5.5 Move to Comment Group 14

2.6 CID 97

2.6.1 Review this proposal.  It is certain that there are FH in the field.  It may be better to reject this comment and allow comments for any correction be made.
2.6.2 Change resolution to “Reject, There are currently deployed devices that support Clause 14 and this clause helps administrators of these systems to support their network.”

2.6.3 Consensus on new resolution

2.6.4 Move to Comment Group 14

2.7 CID 100

2.7.1 Change resolution to “Reject.  The information and the statement are correct.”
2.7.2 The statement may be worded differently, but it would require that a change be done globally for consistency.

2.7.3 A comment on the LB1 should include more definitive description of the issue and the scope of the problem.

2.7.4 Consensus on the new resolution

2.7.5 Move to Comment Group 14

2.8 CID 102

2.8.1 The cited submission (09/0051r1) shows this resolution as a counter. We need to update the resolution.

2.8.2 Change the resolution to “Counter See submission in 11-09/0051r1”

2.8.3 Consensus on the new resolution.

2.8.4 Move to comment Group 14

2.9 Review resolution on CID 7 

2.9.1 Change resolution “Counter.  ….” See 1127r20

2.9.2 Consensus on the updated resolution.

2.10  Motion: Approve comment resolutions in comment group 14 in Document 11-08/1127r20. 

2.10.1 Moved: Adrian Stephens  2nd : Lee Armstrong
2.10.2 Discussion – none

2.10.3 Vote: 4-0-0

2.10.4 Motion passes

2.11 CID 93
2.11.1 From E-mail discussion:

2.11.1.1 “upon review, that the resolution to CID 93 is
incomplete.  (That is, the edit Adrian did is complete, in that it does
what the commenter requested.  But, the commenter requested an
incomplete solution.)  To make sense, we need to also remove the phrase
"and at least one of the four U-APSD flags is set to 1" from the
sentence following the deletion.”

2.11.2 Suggested that we remove the indicated phrase.  This was reviewed and the group agreed to the additional removal.
2.11.2.1 Change the Resolution to say: “Counter – make the proposed change AND remove the remove the phrase "and at least one of the four U-APSD flags is set to 1" from the sentence following the deletion.”

2.11.3 Consensus on the resolution

2.11.4 Move to comment group 13

2.12 Review 09-0003r4 and discussion from E-mail.

2.12.1 Review discussion points
2.12.2 The 1st point was taken care of by TGw (re: disassociate and reassociate)

2.12.3 The idea of removing redundancy is a good idea, but replacing it with different redundancy is not a good thing.
2.12.4 The consensus of the group was that r4 was good enough, and suggest that the further change come during WG LB process.
2.12.5 Ensure that the Resolution for CID 61 points to 09-0003r4.

2.13 Motion: Approve comment resolutions in comment group 13 in Document 11-08/1127r20. 

2.13.1 Moved: Adrian Stephens  2nd : Lee Armstrong

2.13.2 Discussion – none

2.13.3 Vote: 4-0-0

2.13.4 Motion passes

2.14 Review the remaining agenda items.
2.14.1 Interpretation Request
2.14.2 MIB discussion

2.14.3 Review D0.06 changes
2.14.4 Plan for next session

2.15 Interpretation Request #17 – 802.11-2007
2.15.1 Review the proposal on 09-0531r0 and agree with the proposal.

2.15.2 Motion: Accept Interpretation response contained in 09-0531r0 on the subject of power saving, and Authorize the 802.11 Working Group chair to obtain approval from the 802 EC and if approved, forward to the IEEE-SA for publication.
2.15.2.1 Moved Lee Armstrong 2nd Mike Montemurro

2.15.3 No discussion

2.15.4 Vote: 4-0-0 motion passes.

2.16  Given that we have no items for Tuesday AM1, this time slot will be cancelled.

2.17 Recessed 3:30 pm.
3.0 Tuesday AM1 slot cancelled
4.0  Tuesday PM2 4pm EDT
4.1 Called to order at 4:08pm

4.2 Review Agenda: 

4.2.1 MIB Presentation on 11-09/533r0

4.2.2 Review of D0.06.

4.2.3 Recess

4.3 Presentation of Doc 11-09/533r1 – Dave B.
4.3.1 https://mentor.ieee.org/802.11/dcn/09/11-09-0533-01-0arc-recomendation-re-mib-types-and-usage.ppt
4.3.2 Discussion of the MIB definition
4.3.2.1 Comment only one Entity writing an attribute.
4.3.3 Limiting the change and the scope of how extensive the change that should be done.

4.3.4 Suggestion that the MIB edits be done in Frame

4.3.5 Deprecation of portions of the Objects and the rules for elimination.

4.3.6 What does deprecate me?

4.3.6.1 Deprecated should only be used as reference to understand how existing implementations work.

4.3.7 Renaming fields does not necessary deprecate a MIB section.
4.3.7.1 A mapping of old to new names would need to be kept to help migration.

4.3.8 In presenting to other groups, it seems that this is well received, but concerns on how well received the changes would be and when it could be rolled in.

4.3.9 How much effort to get this started?

4.3.9.1 This is part of a chicken and egg problem in that those that are volunteering would not want to do work that is may not be included in a future revision.

4.3.10 What is the gating item to prevent this work from taking place?

4.3.11 How do we implement the rules and changes?
4.3.12 Do we do this in the roll-up or after an amendment is rolled-up?

4.3.12.1 Or do you do the whole MB after all are put in?

4.3.13 The more complex the changes in MB, the less efficient the Amendments will match what they are writing against.

4.3.14 Having new MIB names and control elements should be controlled sooner than later, but when do we make the changes to the older variables.

4.3.15 Which Task Groups would be affected?  And by how much?
4.4 Review latest changes included in D0.06.
4.4.1 Look at the last CIDs approved to make sure that we have put in the changes properly.

4.4.2 Comment Group 13

4.4.2.1 CID 61  -- seems to have been there.

4.4.2.2 CID 93  - -seems ok

4.4.2.3 CID 101 – done.

4.4.3 Comment Group 14

4.4.3.1 CID 7 – this was a change to the resolution, but we verified it in the draft anyway.

4.4.3.2 CID 31 – validated
4.4.3.3 CID 46 – 83 instances were changed.

4.4.3.4 CID 52 – final revision is a bit edited, but better wording...
4.4.3.5 CID  90 – 23  instances – 2 changed before the SDL, and many in the SDL that are not to be changed, but two were missed in Annex H, so will have to be corrected on page 1460.
4.4.3.6 CID 94 – Validated the change

4.4.3.7 CID 102 – changed in the resolution only, but validated that the change had been made.
4.4.4 We found only one defect that will be made and a D0.07 will be created.

4.4.4.1 A draft 1.0 will be made with the tags hidden.

4.5 Motion: Approve D0.07 as the current REVmb draft, and instruct the editor to prepare D1.0 for letter ballot.

4.5.1 Moved: Michael Montemurro, 2nd Jon Rosdahl

4.5.2 Vote: 7-0-0 motion passes.
4.6 Action Item: Matthew to send notification after Adrian completes D1.0.

4.7 We will meet again on Thursday AM2 to conclude business.

4.8 Question how long should the LB be?

4.8.1 We could start our LB on the Monday after our meeting this week.  (May 18)

4.8.2 And we could close the LB on June 27th
4.8.3 This would give us a 40 Day LB
4.9 Teleconference discussion

4.9.1  Only need telecom after the ballot completes.
4.9.2 Approve a Telcon for June 29th at 10am EDT.

4.10 Recess at 6:00pm

5.0 Thursday AM2 10:30 am.
5.1 Called to order 10:30am
5.2 Review Agenda plans for today

5.2.1 Review what redlines are needed?

5.2.2 Letter ballot motion

5.2.3 Preparation for Next Session

5.2.3.1 Review Telcons

5.2.3.2 Review timelines

5.3 What Redlines are needed?

5.3.1 Rev 1.0 is available 

5.3.1.1 The editor tags are removed, but there are still reference links notes.

5.3.2 As this is the first, no redline is required, but it may be good to show the redline between D0.04 (the roll-up version) and D1.0 the changes including the changes from comment.
5.3.3 Concern that the deltas would include defect correction as well as comment changes, so that would be a possible confusion element to it.

5.3.4 The redlines are already available, so no special redline is needed for the LB package.

5.4 Letter ballot Motion

5.4.1 Motion: Having approved comment resolutions for all of the comments received on STD 802.11-2007 and Having incorporated these comment resolutions and all the published amendments (STD 802.11k-2008, STD 802.11r-2008, STD 802.11y-2008), resulting in Draft P802.11REVmb_D1.0, Approve a 40 day Working Group Technical letter Ballot asking the question “Should TGmb Draft 1.0 be forwarded to Sponsor Ballot?

5.4.1.1 Moved:  Adrian Stephens  2nd Jon Rosdahl  

5.4.1.2 Voting: 4-0-0
5.5 Preparation for Next meeting:

5.5.1 Telcons

5.5.1.1 Proposed Telcon Monday June 29 at 10am EDT
5.6 Timeline review

5.6.1 Proposed new timeline

· May 2009 – First WG Letter ballot  

· (includes All published Amendments as of May 2009) 

· Sep/Nov 2009 – Recirc start 

· Jan 2010– Form Sponsor Pool (45 days)

· Mar 2010 – Sponsor Ballot Start 

· (Include all published amendments as of Jan 2010) 

· July 2010 – Sponsor Recirc 

· Mar 2011 – WG/EC Final Approval 

· June 2011 – RevCom/SASB Approval 
· Aug 2011 (8-02-11) Target Publish Date

5.6.2 Discussion of Impacts of timing
5.6.3 When do amendments really get included?

5.6.4 There are three groups of Amendments – those that will be included for sure, those that might and those that won’t.

5.6.5 The ballot process is supposed to track what changes.

5.6.6 Consider that TGs may have to be after the revision
5.6.7 We can constantly re-evaluate the schedule for what may or may not get in.

5.6.8 Discussion on what the purpose of the Revision PAR includes
5.6.9 The difference between publication and The RevCom date may be too short.  The RevCom date may be in May or June, and then it will take 3-4 months to get the over 3000 pages edited, and so we may not want to put the pub target on our published list.
5.6.10 While not on the published list.  We are encouraged to continue to propagate this target for sentimental value.  This should be a fun target to keep in the closing report each session.

5.6.11 Adoption of the changes (in red) to the plan of Record is adopted with out objection:
· May 2009 – First WG Letter ballot  

· (includes All published Amendments as of May 2009) 

· Sep/Nov 2009 – Recirc start 

· Jan 2010– Form Sponsor Pool (45 days)

· Mar 2010 – Sponsor Ballot Start 

· (Include all published amendments as of Jan 2010) 

· July 2010 – Sponsor Recirc 

· Mar 2011 – WG/EC Final Approval 

· June 2011 – RevCom/SASB Approval 
5.7 Action item: Matthew to get the timeline and website update published.

5.8 Other Business

5.8.1 None

5.9 Adjourn 11:09am EDT.
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